
371 18-11

PART
18 - 3 CONVERTIBLE TOP

Section
1 Descriptionand Operation
2 DiagnosisandTesting

Page
- 18-11
18-20

U DESCRIPTION AND OPERATION

Theconvertiblefeaturesautomatic
lowering of the top assemblyinto the
luggagecompartment.The deck lid
completelyconcealsthe top when it
is in the retractedposition. The op
eration of the top is accomplished
by electrically powered mechanical
and hydraulic linkage.

The top operationis divided into
two cycles; the retract cycle in
which the top unlocks and lowers
into the luggage compartment,and
the erect cycle in which the top is
raisedfrom the stackedposition and
locks to the windshield header.

The car should be stoppedandall
side windows loweredbefore the top
is operated.The ignition switch must
me in the ACC or ON position,
preferably with the enginerunning.
The transmissionselectorlever must
be in either the N or P position,
then, actuatethe top control switch.

To retract lower the top, un

fasten the rear window at the zipper
and roll it up. Use the strapswith
the snap buttons provided to hold
it in position. Push the top control
switch down and hold it until the
deck lid has fully opened. Then,
make sure that nothing is stored
in the luggage compartment that
could interfere with the top as it is
lowered.Hold the top control switch
down again until the top retract
cycle is completed.

To erect raisethe top, push the
top control switch up to open the
deck lid andraise the top assembly
into position. After the deck lid
closesandlocks, releasethe top con
trol switch.

The top can be stopped at any
time in either cycle retractor erect
simply by releasing the top control
switch. When the top control switch
is released,the solenoidvalves,which
are connectedto the hydraulic pres

sure lines, close and preventfurther
movementof the top assemblyuntil
the circuit is reactivatedby moving
the top control switch. Do not at
tempt to manually force the top
or the deck lid either up or down.

ELECTRICAL SYSTEM

The electricalsystemincludesfour
reversible motors; the top lock mo
tor, that drives two hook locking
rods that lock and unlock the top to
the windshield header; the upper
back panel motor that drives the
upper back panel by a small trans
mission; the deck lock motor that
locks and unlocks the deck lid
throughflexible drive cables;andthe
top-deck motor that drives a hy
draulic pumpwhich supplieshydraul
ic fluid pressureto open and close
the decklid andthe top assembly.

There are 11 relays; the top con-
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trol neutral relay is used as a safety
device in the control circuit. This
relay is located on the horn relay
mounting plate located behind the
right cowl panel. The control cir
cuit cannot be energized until the
top control neutral relay contacts
are closed. ‘The circuit is complete
only when the neutral switch is
closed. The circuit is closed when
the transmission selector lever is in
P or N and the ignition switch is in
the ACC or ON position. The control
circuit to the top control switch
is identical for both the top retract

cycle and top erect cycle. Current
flows from the ignition switch,
through the top control neutral relay,
the transmission neutral switch, and
the starter motor relay to ground.
The top control neutral relay is en
ergized, closing the relay contacts,
and current flows from the 10-amp
ere circuit breaker through the top
control switch.

The remaining 10 relays are used
to energizethe motors and the three
solenoids Fig. 1.

The electrical system is protected
by five circuit breakers;a 50-ampere

circuit breaker in the power circuit,
a I 0-ampere circuit breaker in the
top control- circuit, and three in
dividual 15-amperecircuit breakers.
one for each motor feed circuit. The
50-amperecircuit breaker is lpcated
on the wiring and circuit breaker
assemblyand the 10-amperecircuit
breaker is located in the fuse box.

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM
The deck lid and convertible top

assemblyare each operated by two
hydraulic cylinders, receiving pres
sure from one electrically powered
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reversiblemotor andpump. Thehy
draulic fluid pressureis controlled
by three electrically activated sole
noid valves, two for the top assem
bly, and one for the deck lid Fig.
2

ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS
The location and proper nomen

clature for each electrical compo
nent is illustrated in Fig. 3. The

function of these componentsis ex
plained in detail with the circuits of
each phaseof the retract and erect
cycle in Figs. 4 through 15.

TOP RETRACT CYCLE
DECK LID UNLOCK

With the top control switch in
the top down position Fig. 4, cur
rentflows from thetop control switch,
through the upper back panel limit

switch, the left handdeckopenlimit
switch usually called deck open
limit switch L.H., andthe deck un
lock relay coil to ground. The deck
unlock relay coil is energized,clos
ing the relay contacts which com
plete the power circuit from the 50-
ampere circuit breaker, through the
15-amperecircuit breakerto the deck
lock motor. The motor is energized
andthe decklid is unlocked.
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DECK LID OPEN

As soon as the deck lid is un
locked, the deck lock limit switch
contacts are repositioned Fig. 5.
The current now flows from the top
control switch through the back
panel retract limit switch, through
the deck open limit switch L.H.,
through the deck lock limit switch
and the deck open relay coil to
ground.This closesthe deckopen re
lay multiple contactswhichcomplete
the power circuits from the 50-amp
ere circuit breakerto the top-deck
motor and the deck solenoid valve.

The deck solenoid valve is ener
gized andthe proper hydraulic lines

are openedto the deck control cyl
inders. At the same time the top-
deck motor is energized and the
deck lid is opened. The deck locks
continue to operateuntil the deck
is completely open.

UPPER BACK PANEL ERECT

When the deck lid is completely
open, the plungerof the deck open
limit switch L.H. is depressedand
the switch contactsare repositioned
Fig. 6. The current now flows
from the top control switch, through
the deck openlimit switch L.H., the
upperbackpanelrelay contactsclose
and the power circuit is completed

throughthe 15-amperecircuit break
er to the upper back panel motor.
The motor is energizedandtheupper
back panel is erected.

TOP UNLOCK

As soon as theupperbackpanel is
in the erectposition, the upperback
panel limit switch is actuated and
the switch contactsare repositioned
Fig. 7. The currentnow flows from
the top control switch, through the
top unlock limit switch, the upper
back panel limit switch and the top
unlock relay coil to ground. The
relay contacts close and complete
the power circuit through the 15-
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ampere circuit breaker to the tp
lock motor. The motor is energized
and the top is unlocked.

TOP RETRACT

When the top is unlocked, the top
unlock limit switch is actuatedand
the switch contactsare repositioned
Fig. 8. The current now flows
from the top unlock limit switch,
through the top down limit switch,
and the top down relay coil to
ground. This closes the relay mul
tiple contacts and completes the
powercircuits to the top-deckmotor.
The two top solenoid valves are
energized and the proper hydraulic

lines are openedto the control cyl
inders. At the same time the top-
deckmotor is energizedandthe top
is lowered into the luggage com
partment.

DECK LID CLOSE AND LOCK

When the top is stowed in the
luggagecompartment,the top down
limit switch is actuated and the
switch contacts are repositioned
Fig. 9. The current now flows
from the top control switch, through
the top down limit switch, the deck
closed limit switch, and the deck
closerelay coil to ground.The relay
contacts are closed and the power

circuit is complete to the top-deck
motor and the deck control solenoid
valve.

The deck control solenoid is en
ergizedandhydraulic lines are open
ed to the deckcontrol cylinders. The
top-deck motor is also energized
and the deck lid is closed. This ac
tion is interrupted when the deck
lid depressestheplungeron the deck
closedlimit switch.

At the same time the deck lid is
closing, the deck lock motor is en
ergized.This is accomplishedby the
current flowing from the top down
limit switch through the deck lock
relay to ground.This closesthe re
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lay contactsand completesthe power
circuit to the deck lock motor. The
deck lock motor is energized until
the top control switch is released.

TOP ERECT CYCLE
DECK LID UNLOCK

With the top control switch in the
top up position, current flows from
the top control switch, through the
top down limit switch, the right hand
deck open limit switch and the deck
unlock relay coil to ground Fig.
10. The relay is energized, the
contacts are closed, and the power

TO

circuit is completedto the deck lock
motor. The motor is energized and
the luggagecompartmentis unlocked.

DECK LID OPEN

As soon as the deck lid is un
locked, the deck closed limit switch
contacts are repositionedFig. 11.
Now the currentflows from the deck
open limit switch R.H., through
the deck closed limit switch, and
the deck open relay to ground. The
relay multiple contacts close and the
power circuits to the deck solenoid
valve and the top-deck motor are

completed. The deck solenoid valve
is energized and the hydraulic lines
are opened to the deck hydraulic
control cylinders.Thetop-deckmotor
is energized and the deck lid is
opened. The deck lock motors con
tinue to run until the deck is com
pletely open.

TOP ERECT

When the deck lid is completely
opened, the deck open limit switch
R.H. plunger is depressedand the
switch contactsarerepositionedFig.
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12. The current now flows from
the top control switch, through the
top up limit switch, the deck open
limit switch R.H., and the top up
relay to ground. The relay multiple
contacts are closed and the power
circuits are completed to the top-
deck motor and the two top con
trol solenoid valves. The two top
control solenoid valves when ener
gized open the hydraulic lines to
the top hydraulic control cylinders;
at the sametime the top-deckmotor
is energizedand the top is erected.

TOP LOCK

As the top approachesthe full up
position, and the packagetray seats
in position, the top up limit switch
rear is depressed,openingthe circuit
to the top up relay Fig. 13. This
stops the top motor and pump as
sembly. At the same time the top
comesin contactwith the windshield
header, the contacts of the top up
limit switch front are closed. The
currentnow flows from the top con
trol switch, through the top up limit
switch front upper back panel limit
switch, and the top lock relay to

ground. The relay contacts close
and the power circuit is completed
to the top lock motor. The motor is
energizedandthe top is locked into
position. The lock motor remains
energizeduntil the upperbackpanel
is retracted.

UPPER BACK PANEL
RETRACT

During the top locking action, the
top lock limit switch is actuatedand
the switch contacts are closed Fig.
14. This permits thecurrentto flow
from the top control switch, through
the top lock limit switch, the upper
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backpanel limit switch, andthe up
per back panel retract relay to
ground. The relay contacts close,
completing the power circuit to the
upper back panel motor, and the
upper back panel is retracted.The
top lock motor remains energized
until the upper back panel is fully
retracted.

DECK LID CLOSE AND LOCK

As soon as the upper back panel

is retracted, the upper back panel
limit switch is actuated and the
switch contacts are repositioned
Fig. 15. This stops the top lock
motor and the upperbackpanel mo
tor. The current now flows from
the top control switch, through the
upper back panel limit switch, the
deck closed limit switch, and the
deck close relay to ground. The
deck close relay multiple contacts

closeandthepowercircuits arecom
plete to the deck control solenoid
valve and the top-deck motor. The
deck control solenoid valve and the
top-deck motor are energized,clos
ing the deck lid. Current also flows
through the upper back panel limit
switch, through the deck lock relay
to ground. The relay is energized,
closing the circuit to the deck lock
motor. As the deck lid reachesthe
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closedposition, the deckclosedlimit closecircuit is broken.The decklock and the locks will ratchet until the
switch is depressedand the deck circuit will continueto be energized, top control switch is released.

fl DIAGNOSIS AND TESTING

To properly accomplishdiagnosis
and testing, the convertible top op
erating principles and sequenceof
operationsshould be thoroughly un

derstood. There should also be an
adequatepower supply from the
battery.

The most common operational

failures will be due to maladjusted
switches in the control circuit. The
power circuits can be individually
operatedby energizing the correct
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power relay by meansot a jumper
wire. The following cautions must
be observed:

1. Do not usean externalpower
source.Extensivedamageto elec
trical componentscould occur if
an externalpower sourceis used.

2. When an individual compo
nent is cycled by meansof a jump
er wire, that componentmust be
returned to its original position
in the top cycle before proceeding.
If this is not done, damageto the
top, deck, and/or back panels
could occur.

This method is applicable since
it permits bypassing various limit
switches and operating the motors
directly. If bypassing a control cir
cuit operatesthe motor, a continuity

check should be made on the com
ponents of that particular control
circuit. However, before this is at
tempted, the motor relay feed
power circuit circuit breaker50-
ampere must be checked and it
must be ascertainedthat the motor
is not jammedor stalled.

I bypassingthe control circuit is
not effective and no mechanicalfail
ure is evident,a failed relay, a failed
motor, or an open circuit in the
motor feed circuit is indicated. The
relay can be bypassedto test the
motor.

If at any point during theopera
tion of the top, a motor continues
to run after a cycle has been com
pleted, and releasingthe top control
switch does not stop the motor,

there is a probability of a stuck re
lay. Disconnect the battery to stop
the motor, then replace the applic
able relay.

Beforeproceeding,themain power
sourcecircuit breaker, the top con
trol neutral relay, and the tcp con
trol switch should be tested, as they
control the complete top circuit. If
no voltage is available at the top
control neutralrelay, the control cir
cuit 10-amperecircuit breakeror the
neutralswitch is at fault. Don’t over
look the hydraulic system. This
system must be operating prop
erly i order to obtain proper
operation of the top.

Sluggish operationof the top or
deck lid assembliesis often accom
paniedby a loud and irregularpump
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noise.Very frequently this is caused
by a low hydraulicfluid level. When
this condition exists, cycle the top
and then check the pump reservoir
for proper fluid level. The fluid level
should be within ¼ inch of the filler
plug hole with the deck lid and top
in the raised position.

EMERGENCY PROCEDURES

MANUALLY UNLOCKING
TOP

If the top unlocking mechanism
becomesinoperative,andthetop will
not unlock at the header,it may be
necessaryto manually unlock the
top by removing the No. 1 bow

access cover and manually turning
the motor coupling to unlock the
top.

MANUALLY OPENING DECK
LID

There are two methodsof opening
the decklid. With a jumper wire the
deck unlock relay plug and deck
openrelay plug can be activated.If
this procedure does not work, the
decklid can be unlockedandopened
mechanically.

Opening Deck Lid With Jumper
Wire.
1. Remove the rear seat cushion

andseatback. This will allow access
to the deck unlock relay and deck
open relay.

2. Fabricate a jumper wire 12
gauge,that has a sufficient capac
ity to conduct50 amperesof current
Fig. 16.

3. Removethe multiple plug from
the deck unlock relay. This is the
relay that is closestto the centerline
of thecar.

4. Energizethe deckunlockmotor
directly through the multiple plug
with the jumper wire. If the motor
doesnot operate,it will be necessary
to mechanicallyunlock the deck lid.
See "Mechanically Opening and
Raising the Deck Lid" in this sec
tion.

5. After the deck lid is unlocked,
actuate the top control switch to
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determineif the deck lid will open
in the normal manner.

6. If the deck lid will not open
by operating the top control switch,
remove the multiple plug from the
deck open relay.

7. Energize the top-deck motor
and pump directly through the mul
tiple plug with the jumper wire. If
the top-deckmotor doesnot operate,
it will be necessaryto mechanically
open the deck lid.

Mechanically Opening and
Raising the Deck Lid
1. Raise the car.
2. From the underside of each

rear wheelhouse,removeeach deck
lid lock nut retainingscrew.

3. From behindthe rearseatcush
ion, disconnectthe deck lid unlock

relay to preventdamageto the lock
nut assembly.

4. Lift the forward edge of the
deck lid approximately one inch,
then actuate the top control switch
to completethe openingof the deck
lid. If the deck lid hydraulic cylin
ders fail to operate,thedecklid can
be manually openedan follows:

a. Unlock the deck lid with the
top control switch or with
the above procedure.

b. From underneath the rear
cross member, remove the
deck lid hydraulic cylinder
attachingscrewsboth sides.

c. Manually lift the deck lid
from the body opening. If the
deck lock nuts havebeenre
leased here from the wheel

housings,the nut andhousing
portion of the locks will re
main attachedto the decklid
lock screws.

ADJUSTMENTS
LIMIT SWITCHES

Accurate adjustment of all the
limit switches is very important to
assuresmoothoperationandto main
tain continuity of thedecklid cycles.
When checking a switch, it should
first be checkedfor proper function
and then adjustedas outlined in the
following procedures.A pair of in
sulated test leads, a jumper wire,
and a self-powered DC test light
are essential tools for testing and
adjusting switches. A self-powered
test light should be used to check
the electrical components. Do not
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use the car battery for the power
source, becausethe jumping of a
switch will cause the cycle to
continue and possibly the cycle
will go out of phase.

Figs. 17 through 24 illustrate the
correct adjustment of the limit
switches.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS
Before a systematictroubleshoot

ing procedureis attempteda trouble
free source of currentshould be es
tablished at the top control switch
andtheservicesideof the 50-ampere
circuit breaker Fig. 3.

POWER SUPPLY CHECK
PROCEDURE

1. Check from the blue wire ter
minal of the 50-ampere circuit
breakerto ground, using a simple
test lamp, a voltmeter or other ap
propriate test equipment, to deter
mine that an adequatevoltagesup
ply is available at this point.

2. Check for full functioning of
the neutral switch and top-control
neutral relay by placing the trans
miSsionselectorlever in neutraland
starting the engine. If any malfunc
tion in this starting circuit is evi

dent, check the circuit and make

repairs.
3. With thestartercircuit function

ing properly,turn the ignition switch
to theON or ACC positionandcheck
for an adequatevoltage supply at
the violet wire terminal of the top
control switch. Use the same equip
ment as in step 1.

4. If difficulties are encountered
in the deck unlock and/ordeck lid
open phasesof the top retract top
erect cycle, when the deck lid is
subsequentlyopen for access,check
the voltage supply at the bus bar on
the relay panel locatedon the inside
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FIG. 11-Deck Open Limit Switches Adjustment

WITH DECK LID FULLY OPEN, ATTACH TEST LIGHT TO NORMALLY CLOSED
SWITCH CONTACTS YELLOW WIRES ON SWITCH. ADJUST SWITCH TO
ACTUATOR UNTIL TEST LIGHT GOES OUT. REPEAT ADJUSTMENT PROCE
DURE FOR LEFT-HAND SWITCH.

VIOLET

ViEW IN DIRECTION
OF ARROW ‘V

Ni 236-B

Ni348-A

PAIRS 3

IF DECK LID SOLENOID VALVE AND TOP AND
DECK MOTOR AND PUMP DO NOT BECOME
ENERGIZED WI-lEN DECK LID IS UNLOCKED, AD.
JUST SWITCH DOWNWARD SLIGHTLY.

IF DECK LID SOLENOID VALVE AND TOP AND
DECK MOTOR AND PUMP BECOME ENERGIZED
BEFORE DECK LID IS COMPLETELY UNLOCKED, AD.
JUST SWITCH UPWARD SLIGHTLY.

18-26

ACTUATOR

DECK OPEN LIMIT SWITCH RIGHT
HAND SHOWN. L.H. SYMMETRICALLY
OPPOSITE.

USE SELF-POWERED TEST LIGHT. WITH
DECK LID OPEN CHECK EACH OPPOSITE
PAIR OF SWITCH WIRE TERMINALS. IF
TEST LIGHT DOES NOT COME ON FOR
EACH TEST, SWITCH IS DEFECTIVE.

BEGIN BY SETTING SWITCH AT MIDPOINT OF
ADJUSTMENT SLOT. ADJUST SWITCH SLIGHTLY
UPWARD OR DOWNWARD UNTIL COMPLETE UN.
LOCKING AND START OF DECK LID OPENING
MOVEMENT ARE SIMULTANEOUS.

FIG. 18-Deck Close Limit Switch Adjustment
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of the right rear quarterpanel.Use bar, and throughthe 15-amperecir- nosis Guide are to be performedthe same equipmentas in step 1. cuit breakers, with thetop control switch pressedAlso checkthe voltagesupply at the 6. When using a self-poweredtest down retract position. In theservice side of the three 15-ampere light for checkingthe limit switches, event of a stop in the cycle, recircuit breakerslocated in the same disconnectthe switch from the cir- lease the control switch to avoid
area. cuit. burningout amotor. If jamming is5. The trouble shooting chartfol- suspected,do not reactivate con-lowing assumesan adequatevoltage TOP RETRACT CYCLE trol switch for over five secondssupply, for system operationpur- All checks and tests detailed in at one time until the condition
poses, at the top control switch, bus the top retract cycle Trouble Diag- is cleared.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID UNLOCK FIG. 4

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

a Deck unlock relay defective. a Move top control switch to up
erect position; listen for
ratcheting of deck lid locks.
Move top control switchto down
position intermittently andlisten
for click of deck unlock relay

1 NO UNLOCKING ACTION-
DECK UNLOCK RELAY NOT

behindrearseatbackcushion.
If no click, removecushionand

FUNCTIONING NO
AUDIBLE CLICK.

b No voltage at relay orange-
brown terminal,

check for voltage at orange-
brown wire terminal. If terminal
is hot,relay is defective. Replace
deckunlock relay.

b Bypass relay by means of a
jumper from relay terminals as
shown in Fig. 16 to activate
deck lock motor.

WITH TOP UP AND THE PACKAGE TRAY ALIGNED WITH REAR SEAT BACK,
ADJUST SWITCH AGAINST PIVOT ARM UNTIL TEST LIGHT GOES OUT.

APPLY SELF-POWERED
TEST LIGHT TO SWITCH
TERMINALS

Ni 349-A

UP LIMIT
REAR

MOUNTING AND

FIG. l9-Top Up Rear Limit Switch Adjustment
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TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDES- TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID UNLOCK FIG. 4 Continued

388

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

a Maladjusted deck closed limit a A maladjusteddeck closedlimit
switch. switch will allow the top-deck

motor andpump to operateand
apply pressureto the deck lift
cylinders and causelock screws
to bind. Release top control

2 NO UNLOCKING ACTION-
DECK UNLOCK RELAY
FUNCTIONING
AUDIBLE CLICK.

b Defective deck lock motor cir-
cuit or motor. Circuit and mo-
tor are inaccessibleuntil deck
is open.

b

switch and unlock deck lid as
outlined in 1 b. If this fails,
deck lid will have to be un
locked mechanically. See3 a
in "Deck Lid Open."SeeFig. 18
for deck closedlimit switch ad
justment.
If jumper is not effective in
activating deck lock motor, the
deck lid will have to be unlocked

LOOSEN SWITCH RETAINING NUTS A AND SWITCH ADJUSTMENT
SCREWS B & C. OPERATE THE UPPER BACK PANEL TO THE DESIRED
ERECT POSITION. ROTATE THE INNER ADJUSTING RING D} UNTIL
THE NORMALLY CLOSED SWITCH CONTACTS OPEN CHECK WITH
SELF-POWERED TEST LIGHT, GREY TO BLACK-BLUE WIRE TERMINALS
LIGHT GOES OUT. TIGHTEN ADJUSTING SCREW B.

NOTE: RED TO BROWN-GREEN WIRE CONTACTS ARE CLOSED
AT THIS POINT.

RETRACT UPPER BACK PANEL UNTIL RUBBER STOPS HAVE BEEN
COMPRESSED 30 TO 60% OF NORMAL. ROTATE THE OUTER
ADJUSTMENT RING El UNTIL TEST LIGHT APPLIED AT GREEN-
WHITE TO RED-WHITE WIRE TERMINALS GOES OUT. CHECK
ORANGE TO RED-GREEN WIRE TERMINALS FOR OPEN CONTACTS.
TIGHTEN ADJUSTING SCREW IC.

NOTED BLACK TO RED WIRE AND VIOLET TO YELLOW WIRE
CONTACTS ARE CLOSED AT THIS POINT.

AFTER BOTH ADJUSTMENTS HAVE BEEN ACCOMPLISHED, TIGHTEN
SWITCH RETAINING NUTS A.

OUTER ADJUSTMENT
RING E

VIEW IN DIRECTION
OF ARROW X

GREY

BLUE.
BLACK

BROWN.
GREEN

Ni35i-A

FIG. 2O-Upper Back Panel Limit Switch Adjustment
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TOP DOWN
LIMIT SWITCH

MOUNTING
ADJUSTING

VIOLET

18-29

TEST VIOLET-WHITE TO YELLOW-WHITE PAIR OF WIRE TERMINALS. ADJUST SWITCH
AGAINST PIVOT ARM UNTIL TEST LIGHT GOES OUT. TEST REMAINING TWO PAIRS
OF WIRE TERMINALS RED TO VIOLET-WHITE AND YELLOW TO BROWN. IF THE
TEST LIGHT DOES NOT COME ON, THE SWITCH IS DEFECTIVE.

FIG. 21-Top Down Limit Switch Adjustment

RAISE THE TOP UNTIL THE NO. I BOW RESTS FIRMLY ON THE WINDSHIELD HEADER
AND THE LOCK HOOKS ARE ALIGNED WITH THE HOOK POCKETS. -ADJUST THE
SWITCH FORWARD UNTIL TEST LIGHT COMES ON.

Ni354.A

ARM

VIOLET-WHITE STRIPE

RED

BROWN

YELLOW

ATTACH SELF-POWERED TEST LIGHT TO
WIRE TERMINALS.

FIG. 22-Top Up Front Limit Switch Adjustment
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PART 1 8-3-CONVERTIBLE TOP ‘18-31

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID UNLOCK FIG. 4 Continued

1 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
DECK OPEN RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING

a Defective deck open relay cy
cling stops as soon as deck lid
locks clear.

b Defective circuit. Top control
switchthroughupperbackpanel
limit switch, deck open limit
switch L.H. and deck closed
limit switch to yellow-violetwire
terminal on deckopen relay.

c Defective upper back panel limit
switch.

d Defectivedeckopenlimit switch
L.H. Deck lid must not be fully
open to avoid repositioning of
switch terminals.

a Check for voltage at yellow-
violet wire terminalof deckopen
relay. If terminal is hot, relay is
defective. Replace deck open
relay. SeeFig. 16.

b If yellow-violet wire terminal of
deck open relay is dead, use a
jumper to bypassthe deckopen
relay and activate the top and
deckmotor and pump the deck
control solenoid to raise the
deck lid. SeeFig. 16. Seealso
malfunction 3 b, c and d.

c With deckopen for access,RE
LEASE TOP CONTROL
SWITCH, using a self-powered
test light check for opencircuit
between red wire terminal and
black wire terminalof the eight-
terminalgroup. If light doesnot
come on, the switch should be
adjustedbefore decidingit is de
fective. Replacedefectiveupper
back panel limit switch. At this
time check violet to yellow wire
terminals of the eight-terminal
group and grey to black-blue
wire terminal of four-terminal
group.

d TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Using a self-powered
test light, checkfor opencircuit
betweenyellow wire terminalsof
switch. If test light fails to come
on, switch is defective. Also
check yellow wire terminals of
deckopenlimit switch R.H. Re
placedeckopenlimit switches
found defective.

391

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

2 NO UNLOCKING ACTION-
DECK UNLOCK RELAY
FUNCTIONING AUDIBLE

mechanically to gain accessto
deck lock motor and compjete
circuit.

CLICK. Continued

3 NO UNLOCKING ACTION- a Broken flexible shaft or loose a Unlock deck lid mechanically.
DECK LOCK MOTOR lock nuts, one or both sides.
RUNNING

a Maladjusted deck closed limit
switch allows top-deck motor

a When decklid hasbeenopened,
adjust deck closedlimit switch.

4 UNLOCKING ACTION- and pump to operate early in Fig. 18.
DECK LID JUMPS OFF LOCKS phaseandapply pressureto deck

lid hydraulic cylinders before
locks are clear.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID OPEN FIG. 5

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE
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TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID OPEN FIG. 5 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

1 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
DECK OPEN RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING Continued,

e Defective deck closed limit
switch. Deck lid open for ac-
cess.

e TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE-
LEASED. Using a self-powered
test light, checkfor opencircuit
betweenyellow wires, red wires,
and white wires of switch. If test
light fails to come on for any
check, switch is defective. Re
place deckclosed limit switch.

2 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
DECK OPEN, RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING. DECK BUMPS
UP AND DOWN ON LOCKS

a Maladjusted deck closed limit
switch,

a Raisethe decklid manuallyuntil
deck motor and pump become
energized.After decklid is open,
adjust deck closedlimit switch.
SeeFig. 18.

a Defective power circuit to top- a A defective power circuit or
deck motor and pump or deck defectivemotor or solenoidwill
control solenoid, preventdeckopeningregardless

of relay function and will be
evident when relay jumper is
applied. See 1 b. Deck lid
must be openedmechanicallyto
gain accessfor repairs.

b Defective deck lock motor cir- b TOP CONTROL SWITCH REcuit or motor. LEASED. If decklock motor is
not functioning, check power
circuit for voltageat motorred-
yellow wire terminal. Deck lid
should be open, sufficient for
access,only to avoid reposition
ing of deck open limit switch
L.H. If no voltage, repairthe
circuit. If terminal is hot, motor
is defective. Replacedecklock
motor.

3 NO DECK OPENING ACTION- c Broken deck lock flexible c TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE-FUNCTIONING DE K shafts. LEASED. Unlock deck lid me-OPEN RELAY
chanically. With deck lid open
check deck lid lock shafts a’nd
lock nuts. If shafts are bro
ken, replace shafts. Otherwise,
tighten lock nuts.

d Faulty deck control solenoid d Open deck lid mechanically.valve or top-deck motor and Check solenoid and motor cirpump assemblypower Circuits. cuits. Repairfaulty circuit Fig.
5.

e Faulty deck control solenoid e TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE-valve. LEASED. Open deck lid me
chanically, sufficient for access.
If circuit checksout hot at blue-
red terminal on valve and the
top-deck motor andpump oper
ates when top control switch
is momentarily depressed,but
there is no action at deck open
ing cylinders, the solenoid valve
is defective. Replacevalve.

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



DECK OPEN-NO UPPER
BACK PANEL ACTION-
UPPER BACK PANEL ERECT

I RELAY NOT FUNCTiONING
NO AUDIBLE CLICK

PART 18-3-CONVERTIBLE TOP

b Defectivedeckopenlimit switch
L.H. to upper back panelerect
relay circuit.

c Defective deckopenlimit switch
L.H.

d Defective upper back panel
limit switch. If defective circuits
are found at this switch after
switchterminalshavebeenreposi
tioned by erection of upper back
panel, check red-green to orange
and red-white to green-white wire
terminals of 8-terminal group and
red to brown-green wire terminals
of 4-terminal group.

e Defectivepower circuit to upper
back panel erect relay.

a Depress top control switch in
termittently while listening for
click. If no click, checkfor volt
age at black-bluewire terminal
onrelay. If terminal is hot, relay
is defective.Replaceupperback
panel relay.

b Check out circuit from black-
blue terminal on upper back
panel erect relay connector,
through upper back panel limit
switch, to violet wire terminal
on deck open limit switch L.H.
repair circuit. See 1 d.

c Loosen switch actuator, press
switchplungerall thewayin and
check betweenviolet wire ter
minals on switch with self-pow
ered test light. If light does not
come on, switch is defective.
Also check violet wire termin
als of deck open limit switch
L.H. Replace defective deck
open limit switches.

d If circuit check performed in
1 b showed open circuit at
black-blueto grey terminals of
upper back panel limit switch,
adjust the four-terminal section
of switch. If adjustment does
not close circuit, switch is de
fective. Replace upper back
panel limit switch.

e Checkbetweengroundandblue-
white wire terminal on upper
backpanel motor. If terminal is
dead, circuit is open. Repaircir
cuit.

393 18-33

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE-TOP RETRACT CYCLE-DECK LID OPEN FIG. 5 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

3 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
FUNCTIONING DECK OPEN
RELAY Continued.

f Faulty top-deckmotor andpump
assembly.

f TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Open deck lid me
chanically, sufficient for access.
If circuit checkshot at red wire
terminal of motor and pump as-
sembly and motor does not op
erate when top control switch is
momentarilydepressed,motor is
defective. Replacetop-deckmo
tor andpump assembly.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - UPPER BACK PANEL ERECT FIG. 6

a Defectiveupperbackpanelerect
relay.

1

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



1 UPPER BACK PANEL ERECT-
NO TOP UNLOCK ACTION.
TOP UNLOCK RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING NO
AUDIBLE CLICK

b Defectivetop unlocklimit switch
to top unlockrelay circuit.

d Defective power circuit to top
unlock motor.

e Defectiveupperbackpanel limit
switch.

If defectivecircuitsarefound at
this switch after switch terminals
have been repositionedby erec
tion of upper back panel, check
switch adjustments before switch
is considereddefective.

f Defective top lock motor.

a Depress top control switch in
termittently andlisten for relay
click. If no click, bypass relay
with jumper.If top lock motor is
activated, check for voltage at
red wire terminal on relay. If
terminal is hot, relay is defec
tive. Replace top unlock relay.
If redwire terminal is dead,pro
ceed asin 1 b, c, and e.
If top lock motor is not acti
vatedby jumping the relaycon
nector, proceed as in 1 d in
"Top Retract."

b Checkout circuit from red wire
terminal on top unlock relay,
through upperback panel limit
switch, to brown-greenwire ter
minal on top unlocklimit switch.
Repaircircuit. See 1 d in "Top
Retract."

c Check betweenyellow wire ter
minal and brown wire terminal
on top unlock limit switchwith
self-poweredtest light. Manually
repositionswitch andcheckyel
low to white wire terminals. If
light fails to comeon eitherway,
switch is defective. Replacetop
unlock limit switch.

d Check between ground and
black-yellow wire terminal on
motor. If terminal is dead,cir
cuit is open. Repaircircuit.

e If circuit chcek performed in
1 b showed open circuit at
red to brown-greenterminalsof
upper back panel limit switch,
adjust the four-terminal section
of the switch. If adjustmentdoes
not close the circuit, the switch
is defective. Replaceupperback
panel limit switch.

f If yellow-black terminal wire is
hot at motor case,motor is de
fective. Replacetop lock motor.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - TOP RETRACT FIG. 8

a Defective top down relay. a Depress top control switch in
termittently and listen for relay

1 TOP RETRACT-NO TOP
ACTION-TOP DOWN RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING. ‘NO
AUDIBLE CLICK

click. If no click, bypassrelay
with jumper to activate top-deck
motor and pump. Checkfor cur-
rent at yellow-white wire ter
minal on relay. If terminal is
hot, relay is defective. Replace

18-34 GROUP 18-TRIM, SEATS, AND CONVERTIBLE TOP

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE-TOP RETRACT CYCLE-TOP UNLOCK FIG. 7

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

394

a Faulty top unlock relay.

c Defectivetop unlocklimit switch.

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE
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TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE -TOP RETRACT FIG. 8 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

a Continued top down relay. If yellow-white
wire terminal is dead, proceed

as in 2 b, c, and d.

b Defective top unlock limit switch
to top downrelay circuit.

b Checkcircuit from yellow-white
wire terminalon top down relay,
through top down limit switch
to white wire terminal on top
unlock limit switch. Repaircir
cuit. See2 c and d.

1 TOP RETRACT-NO TOP
ACTION-TOP DOWN RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING. NO
AUDIBLE CLICK Continued

e Defective top unlock limit
switch. See top unlock phase.

c Check switch adjustmentwith
the top unlock switch fully de
pressed. Check between white

wire terminal and yellow wire
terminal on top unlock switch
with self-poweredlight. If light
fails to come on, switch is de
fective. Replacetop unlock limit
switch.

d Defectivetop down limit switch. d Check between yellow - white
wire terminal and violet-white
wire terminal on top down limit
switch with self-powered test
lamp. If lamp fails to come on,
switch is defective. Replacetop
down limit switch.

2 NO TOP RETRACT ACTION- a Defective top control solenoid a Check for voltage at the white-
TOP DOWN RELAY valves, blue wire at the top control sole-.
FUNCTIONING AUDIBLE noid valves. If wire is hot, sole-
CLICK. TOP-DECK MOTOR noid valve is defective. If wire
AND PUMP ASSEMBLY is dead,checkpower circuit and
OPERATING repair.

3 NO TOP RETRACT ACION- Ia Defective top-deck motor and a Check voltage at the yellow
TOP DOWN RELAY pump assemblyor power circuit. wire at top motor andpump as-
FUNCTIONING AUDIBLE sembly. If wire is hot, motor is

CLICK. TOP-DECK MOTOR defective. If wire is dead, check
AND ,PUMP ASSEMBLY
NOT OPERATING I_______________________

power circuit and repair.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID CLOSE AND LOCK FIG. 9

1 a Defectivedeck close relay. a Check for voltage at black-

I greenwire terminal-on relay. If
terminalis hot, relayis defective.
Replace deck close relay. If
black-green wire terminal is
dead,proceedas in malfunction

1 NO DECK CLOSE ACTION- 1 b below.

DECK CLOSE RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING

b Defective deck close relay to
top down limit switch circuit.

b Check out circuit from black-
green wire terminal on deck
close relay through deck closed
limit switch to violet-white wire
terminal on top down limit
switch. Repaircircuit. Seemal

- function 2 c on following page.

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



18-36 GROUP 18-TRIM, SEATS, AND CONVERTIBLE TOP

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP RETRACT CYCLE - DECK LID CLOSE AND LOCK FIG. 9 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

c Defectivetop down limit switch.
Seetop retractingphase.

c Checkbetweenviolet-white wire
terminal and red wire terminal
on top down limit switch with
self-poweredtest light. If light

1 NO DECK CLOSE
ACTION-DECK CLOSE
RELAY NOT FUNCTIONING
Continued d Defective deck closed limit

switch.

fails to come on switch is de
fective. Replace top down limit
switch.

d Check betweenred wire termi
nals on deck closedlimit switch
with self-powered test light. If
light fails to comeon, switch is
defective. Replace deck closed
limit switch.

2 NO DECK CLOSE ACTION- a Defective deck control solenoid a Check for voltage at deck con-
DECK CLOSE RELAY valve. trol solenoid valve lead. If wire
FUNCTIONING-TOP AND is hot, solenoid valve is defec
DECK MOTOR AND PUMP tive. If wire is dead checkpower
ASSEMBLY IS OPERATING circuit and repair.

3 NO DECK CLOSE ACTION- a Defective top-deck motor and a Checkvoltage at the yellow wire
DECK CLOSE RELAY pump assemblyor power circuit. at top-deckmotor andpump as-
FUNCTIONING. TOP-DECK sembly. If wire is hot, motor is
MOTOR AND PUMP NOT defective. If wire is dead,check
OPERATING power circuit and repair.

a Defective deck lock relay. Deck
lock relay is activated simul-

a Check for voltage at the violet-
red wire terminal of relay. If

4 NO DECK LOCK ACTION taneously with deck close re- wire is hot, deck lock relay is
DECK LOCK MECHANISM NOT lay. defective. If wire terminal is
FUNCTIONING WHEN DECK dead, check for break in violet-
LID STARTS TO CLOSE red wire to violet-white wire cir

cuit to the deck closed limit
switch. Repair circuit.

a Open power circuit to deck lock
motor or defective deck lock
motor.

a When deck lid starts to close,
observe deck lock mechanism.
If deck lock mechanismis no
functioning disconnectthe motor
leadsat the motor. Usea jumper

5 NO DECK LOCK ACTION
DECK LOCK RELAY
FUNCTIONING

and yellow-blue wire receptcl
of decklock relay connector.If
motor operates, power circuit
yellow wire is open. Repair
circuit. If motor doesnot oper
ate, motor is defective. Replace
deck lock motor. Releasetop
control switch.

TOP ERECT CYCLE phases. The circuits, switches,and/or In theevent of a stop in the cycle,
The top erect cycle utilizes the switch positions differ in the various releasethecontrol switch to avoid

samemotors as the top retractcycle, phases. All checks and tests de- burning out a motor. If jamming
These motors, however, operate in tailed in theTop ErectCycle Diag- is suspected,do not reactivatethe
the reversedirection of that for the nosis Guide are to be performed control switch for over five see-
retract cycle in the upper hackpanel with the top control switch pushed onds at one time until the condi
retract, top erect, and top lock up erect position. tion is cleared.

396
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TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - DECK LID UNLOCK FIG. 10

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

a Deck unlock relay defective. a Move top control switch to
down retract position. Listen
for ratchetingof decklid locks.
Move top control switch to up
erect position intermittently
and listen for click of deck un

1 NO UNLOCKING ACTION- lock relay behind rear seat back
DECK UNLOCK RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING NO AUDIBLE
CLICK

cushion. If no click, remove
cushion and check for voltage at
orange-brownwire terminal. If
terminal is hot, relay is defec
tive. Replacedeck unloadrelay.

b No voltage at relay orange- b Bypass deck unlock relay by
brown terminal. Also see 1 b meansof a jumper at connector
‘Deck Lid Open." terminals, as shown in Fig. 10,

to activate decklock motor.

a Maladjusted deck closed limit a A maladjusteddeckclosedlimit
switch. switch will allow the top-deck

motor andpump to operateand
apply pressureto the deck lift
cylinders and causelock screws
to bind. Release top control
switch and unlock deck lid as
outlined in I b. If this fails,

2 NO UNLOCKING ACTION-
DECK UNLOCK RELAY
FUNCTIONING
AUDIBLE CLICK

deck lid will have to be un
locked mechanically. See 3 a,
"Deck Lid Open." See Fig. 18
for deck closedlimit switch ad
justment.

b Defective deck lock motor cir-
cuit or motor. Circuit and

b If jumper is not effective in ac
tivating deck lock motor, the

motor are inaccessible until deck lid will have t& be Un-
deck is open. locked mechanicallyto gain ac

cess to deck lock motor and
complete circuit. See 2 a,
"Deck Lid Open."

3 I1O UNLOCKING ACTION- a Broken flexible shaft or loose a Unlock deck lid mechanically.
DECK LOCK MOTOR lock nuts, one or both sides.
RUNNING

a Maladjusted deck closed limit a When deck lid hasbeenopened,
switch allows top-deck motor adjust deck closed limit switch.

4 UNLOCKING ACTION-DECK and pump to operate early in See Fig. 18.
LID JUMPS OFF LOCKS phase and apply pressure to deck

lid hydraulic cylinders before
locks areclear.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - DECK LID OPEN FIG. 11

1 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
DECK OPEN RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING

a Defective deck open relay cy-
cling stops as soon as deck lid
locks clear,

a Check for voltage at yellow
violet wire terminalof deck open
relay. If terminal is hot, relay is
defective. Replacedeckopenre
lay. See Fig. 16.

397 18-37
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1 NO DECK OPENING
ACTION-DECK OPEN
RELAY NOT FUNCTIONING
Continued

b Defective circuit. Top control
switch through the top down
limit switch, the deck openlimit
switch R.H., andthe deckclosed
limit switch to the yellow-violet
wire terminal on the deckopen
relay Fig. 11.

c Defect in top down limit switch.

d Defectivedeckopenlimit switch
RH. Deck lid must not be
fully opento avoid reposition
ing of switch terminals.

e Defective deck closed limit
switch. Deck lid open for ac

b If yellow-violet wire terminal of
deck open relay is dead, use a
jumper to bypassthe deck open
relay and activatethe top-deck
motor andpump and deck con
trol solenoid to raise the deck
lid Fig. 16. Seein "Deck Lid
Unlock." 4 b, c and d.

c With deck lid open for access
only, use a self-powered test
lamp to checkbrown to yellow
wire terminalsof top down limit
switch. Light should come on.
Also check red to violet-white
pair of wire terminals. Light
should come on. If light does
not come on in either case,
switch is defective. Replacetop
down limit switch.

d TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Using a self-powered
test light, check for open circuit
betweenyellow wire terminals
of switch. If test light fails to
come on, switch is defective.
Also checkyellow wire terminals
of deck open limit switch R.H.
Replacedeckopenlimit switch
es found defective.

e TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Using a self-powered
test light, checkfor open circuit
betweenyellow wires, red wires,
andwhite wires of switch. If test
fails to come on for any check,
switch is defective.Replacedeck
closedlimit switch.

18-38 GROUP 18-TRIM, SEATS, AND CONVERTIBLE TOP

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - DECK LID OPEN FIG. 11 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

398

cess.

2 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
DECK OPEN RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING. DECK BUMPS
UP AND DOWN ON LOCKS

a Maladjusted deck closed limit
switch.

a Raise deck lid manually until
deck motor and pump become
energized.After decklid is open,
adjust deck closed limit switch
Fig. 18.

3 NO DECK OPENING ACTION-
DECK OPEN RELAY
FUNCTIONING

a Defective power circuit to top-
deck motor and pump or deck
control solenoid.

b Defective deck lock motor cir-
cuit or motor.

a A defective power circuit or
defectivemotor or solenoid will
preventdeckopening regardless
of relay function and will be
evident when relay jum,er is
applied. See I b, "Deck Lid
Open-Top Retract Cycle."Deck
lid must be openedmechanically
to gain accessfor repairs.

b TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. If decklock motor is
not functioning, check power
circuit for voltage at motor red
yellow wire terminal. Deck lid
should be open sufficient for

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



3 NO DECK OPENiNG
ACTION-DECK OPEN
RELAY FUNCTIONING
Continued

4 NO TOP ERECTING ACTION-
TOP UP RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING
NO AUDIBLE CLICK

PART 1 8-3-CONVERTiBLE TOP

e Broken deck lock flexible
shafts.

d Faulty deck control solenoid
valve or top-deck motor and
pump assemblypowercircuits.

te Faulty deck control solenoid

1 Faulty top deckmotorandpump
assembly.

b Detective circuit from top con
trol switch, through top up limit
switch rear, deck open limit
switch R.H. to top up relay.

c Defective top up limit switch.

accessonly to avoid reposition
ing of deck open limit swjtch
L.H. If no voltage, repair the
circuit. See 1 b. if terminal
is hot, motor is defective. Re
placedecklock motor.

c TOP CONTROL SWiTCH RE
LEASED. With deck lid open
check deck lid lock shafts and
lock nuts. if shafts arebroken,
replaceshafts. Otherwisetighten
lock nuts.

d Open deck lid mechanically.
Check solenoid and motor cir
cuits. Repair faulty circuit Fig.
5.

e TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Open deck lid me
chanically, sufficient for access.
if circuit checksout hot at blue-
red terminal on valve and the
top-deck motor and pump op
erate when top control switch is
momentarily pushed up, but
thereis no actionat deck open
ing cylinders, the solenoid valve
is defective.Replacevalve.

f TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Open deck lid me
chanically, sufficient for access.
Ii circuit chcc hut at red wire
terminalof motcc and pump as
seinbly and motor does not op
eratewhen top control switch is
momentarily pushed up, motor
is defective. Replace top-deck
motor and pump assembly.

a Push top control switch up in
termittently while listening for
click of relay. If no click, check
for voltage at green wire ter
rninal on relay, if terminal is
hot, relay is defective. Replace
top up relay. if greenwire terrni
nal is dead proceed as in 4 b.

b LOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Check out circuit and
switchesusinga self-poweredtest
light Fig. 12. See 4 c and
d.

c TO1 CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Check between ter
minals of switch. I light fails to
comeon, switch is defective.Re
place top up limit switch.
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Malfunction } Probable Cause Corrective Action

h Continued

18-39

valve.

ta Defective top up relay.
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TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - DECK LID OPEN FIG. 1 1 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

4 NO TOP ERECTING
ACTiON-TOP UP
RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING
NO AUDIBLE CLICK
Continued

d Defective deckopenlimit switch
R.H.

d TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Check betweenviolet
wire terminals of switch. If light
fails to come on, switch is de
fective. Replacedeck open limit
switch. See 1 c, "Upper Back
PanelErect-TopRetractCycle."

a Defective top and deck motor a Disconnectthe 2-wire connector
andpump assembly. on motor leads. Jumper from

each motor lead in turn to bus
bar on relay panel. If motor is
not activated,it is defective.Re
place top-deckmotor and pump
assembly.

b Defectivetop-deckmotor power
circuit.

b If motor will operate, connect
leads disconnectedin 5 a
above and push top control

5 NO TOP ERECT ACTION
TOP UP RELAY
FUNCTIONING

switch up. If motor still doesnot
operate,the motorpower circuit
is defective.Repairdefectivecir
cuit red wire or yellow wire.

c Defective top control solenoid c Disconnectsolenoid valve leads,
valvespower circuits. and with ordinary test lamp,

checkfor voltage from lead ter
minal to ground. If either or
both leads are defective, check
and repairwire circuit Fig. 13.

d Defective top control solenoid
valves,

d If solenoidpower leads is hot,
solenoid valves is defective.
Replace top control solenoid
valve.

TROUBL E DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - TOP LOCK FIG. 13

a Defective top lock relay. a Push top control switch up in
termittently, while listening for
click. If no click, check for
voltage at orangewire terminal
of relay connector. If wire is
hot, relay is defective. Replace
top lock relay. If orange wire
terminal is deadproceed as in
5 b, "Deck Lid Open - Top

1 NO
TOP

TOP LOCK ACTION-
LOCK RELAY NOT

Erect Cycle." The top lock relay
may be bypassed and the top
lock motor may be energizedby

FUNC
AUDI

TIONING NO
BLE CLICK

.a jumper wire from centerrecep
tacle to the black-red wire re
ceptacleof top lock relay con
nector. See 1 e.

b Defective circuit from top con-
trot switch, through top up limit
switch front, and upper back
panel limit switch to top lock

b TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE-
LEASED.Checkout circuit wir
ing and switches using self-
powered test light Fig. 13.

relay. Remove top front bow See I c and d.
cover to reach top lock motor
and switches.
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1 NO UPPER BACK PANEL
RETRACT ACTION-RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING NO
AUDIBLE CLICK

PART 18-3--CONVERTIBLE TOP

b Defective circuit from top con
trol switch, through the top lock
limit switch, and the upper back
panel retractrelay.

c Defective top lock limit switch.

d Defective upperback panel limit
switch.

e Defective upper back panel mo
tor or power circuit Fig. 14.

a Push top control switch up in
termittently while listening for
relay click. if no click, check
for voltage at the red-whitewire
receptacleof therelayconnector.
If circuit is hot,relay is defective.
Replace upper back panel re
tract relay. If circuit is dead,
proceedas in 1 b.

b TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
LEASED. Checkout circuit wir
ing and switches using self-
powered test light Fig. 14,
see 1c and d.

c Open No. I top bow cover and
apply test light betweenthe ter
minals of switch. The switch
plunger should be fully de
pressedwhen top is locked. If
light doesnot comeon, switch is
defective. Replacetop lock limit
switch.

d Using self-powered test light,
check betweenthe green-white
andthe red-whitewire terminals
of the switch. If light does not
come on, make sure the switch
is properly adjusted before de
ciding it is defective Fig. 20.

e Disconnect motor leads at mo
tor. Use a jumper betweeneach
motor lead and bus bar on relay
panel.If motor doesnot operate,
the motor is defective. Replace
upperback panelmotor. If mo
tor operates, check the power
circuitsbackto the relayandthe
15-amperecircuit breaker.

401 18-41

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - TOP LOCK FIG. 13 Continued

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

1 NO TOP LOCK ACTION-
TOP LOCK RELAY NOT
FUNCTIONING NO
AUDIBLE CLICK
Continued

c Defective top up limit switch
front.

d Defective upperbackpanel limit
switch.

e Defective top lock motors or
circuit. See 5 a, "Deck Lid
Open-Top ErectCycle."

c

d

e

Open top No. 1 bow cover.
Check betweenwire terminalsof
switch. If light does not come
on, switch is defective. Replace
top up limit switch front.
Check between red-green and
orange wire terminals. If test
light does not come on, switch
is defective.

If top Jock motor or circuit is
found to bedefectivewhen relay
is bypassed by jumper, check
the motor circuit for voltage at
the live side of the motor con
nector.If circuit is dead, repair
circuit black-red wire. If cir
cuit is hot, motor is defective.
Replacetop lock motor.

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - UPPER BACK PANEL RETRACT FIG. 14

a Defective upper back panel re
tract relay.

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



GROUP 18-TRIM, SEATS, AND CONVERTIBLE TOP

TROUBLE DIAGNOSIS GUIDE - TOP ERECT CYCLE - DECK LID CLOSE AND LOCK FIG. 15

Malfunction Probable Cause Corrective Action

a Defective deck closerelay. a Checkfor voltage at black-green
wire terminal on relay. If ter
minal is hot, relay is defective.
Replace deck close relay. If
black-green wire terminal is
dead,proceedas in 1 b.

b Defective circuit from top con- b TOP CONTROL SWITCH RE
trol switch, through the upper LEASED.Checkout circuit wir
backpanel limit switch, andthe ing and switches using self-

1 NO DECK CLOSE ACTION-
deckclosedlimit switchto relay. powered test light Fig. 15.

See 1 c and d.
DECK CLOSE RELAY
NOT FUNCTIONING c Defective upper backpanel limit

switch.
c Checkbetweenviolet andyellow

wires of switch. If the light does
not comeon, switch is defective.
Check switch adjustmentbefore
replacingswitch.

d Defective deck closed limit
switch.

d Check betweenred wire termi
nals on deck closedlimit switch
with self-poweredtest light. If
light fails to comeon, switch is
defective. Replace deck closed
limit switch.

2 NO DECK CLOSE ACTION- a Defective deck control solenoid a Check for voltage at deck con-
DECK CLOSE RELAY valve. trol solenoid valve lead. If wire
FUNCTIONING. TOP-DECK is hot, solenoid valve is defec
MOTOR AND PUMP tive. If wire is dead, check
ASSEMBLY IS OPERATING power circuit and repair.

3 NO DECK CLOSE ACTION- a Defective top-deck motor and a Checkvoltageat the yellow wire
DECK CLOSE RELAY pump assembly or power circuit. at top motor and pump as-
FUNCTIONING. TOP-DECK sembly. If wire is hot, motor is
MOTOR AND PUMP NOT defective. If wire is dead,check
OPERATING power circuit and repair.

4 NO DECK LOCK ACTION- a Defective deck lock relay. Deck a If relay is not activated in the
DECK LOCK MECHANISM lock relay is activated simulta- cycle, relay is defective.
NOT FUNCTIONING WHEN neously with deck close relay.
DECK LID STARTS
TO CLOSE

a Open power circuit to deck lock
motor or defective deck lock
motor.

a When deck lid starts to close,
observe deck lock mechanism.
If deck lock mechanism is not
functioning,disconnectthemotor
leadsat themotor. Usea jumper

5 NO DECK LOCK ACTION- between motor yellow-red lead
DECK LOCK and yellow-bluewire receptacle
RELAY FUNCTIONING of deck lock relay connector.If

motor operates, power circuit
yellow wire is open. Repair
circuit. If motor does not op
erate,motor is defective.Replace
deck lock motor.
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