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FOUR-SPEED AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 

CROSS-REFERENCE TO RELATED 
APPLICATION 

This application is a division of application Ser. No. 5 
08/345,669, titled “Four-Speed Automatic Transmission” 
?led Nov. 28, 1994 by the same inventor as in the present 
application now U.S. Pat. No. 5,588,929. 

BACKGROUND OF THE INVENTION 

1. Field of the Invention 
The present invention relates generally to automatic trans 

missions for vehicles and, more particularly, to a four-speed 
automatic transmission for an automotive vehicle. 

2. Description of the Related Art 
A conventional automatic transmission includes a hydro 

dynamic torque convertm' to transfer engine torque from an 
engine crankshaft to a rotatable input member of the trans 
mission through ?uid-?ow forces. The transmission also 
includes frictional units, typically referred to as clutches, 
which couple the rotatable input member to one or more 
members of a planetary gearset. Other frictional units, 
typically referred to as brakes, hold one or more members of 
the planetary gearset stationary during the ?ow of power. 
Such transmissions also typically provide for one or more 
planetary gearsets in order to provide various ratios of 
torque and to ensure that the available torque and the 
respective tractive power demand are matched to each other. 
An example of an automatic transmission having a plu 

rality of planetary gearsets is a four-speed automatic trans 
mission disclosed in U.S. Pat. No. 4,875,391 to Leising et al. 
This patented four-speed automatic transmission includes a 
torque converter with a lock-up clutch, three drive clutch 
assemblies, two brake assemblies, and two planetary gear 
sets. 

A disadvantage of the above patented four-speed auto 
matic transmission is that to provide a 0.75 overdrive ratio 
in the arrangement of the planetary gearsets results in an 
excessive ratio step between ?rst and second gear, e.g., 3.00 
and 1.50, respectively. 

SUMMARY OF THE INVENTION 

It is, therefore, one object of the present invention to 
provide a four-speed automatic transmission for an automo 
tive vehicle. 

It is another object of the present invention to provide a 
four-speed automatic transmission with a 0.75 overdrive 
ratio. 

It is yet anothu' object of the present invention to provide 
a four-speed automatic transmission that provides an accept 
able ratio step between ?rst and second gear. 

It is still another object of the present invention to provide 
a four-speed automatic u'ansmission with a unique planetary 
gear arrangement which, relative to today’ s four-speed units, 
provides a 0.75 overdrive ratio with good ratio spacing. 
To achieve the foregoing objects, the present invention is 

a four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle including 
a transmission housing, an input membu', an output member, 
three planetary gearsets for changing a ratio of torque 
between the input member and the output member, a plu 
rality of clutch assemblies to selectively couple the input 
member to predetermined gears of the planetary gearsets and 
a plurality of brake assemblies to selectively couple prede 
termined gears of the planetary gearsets to the transmission 
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housing, and means for allowing the output member and a 
planetary carrier of one of the planetary gearsets and an 
annulus gear of another of the planetary gearsets to rotate 
simultaneously. 
One advantage of the present invention is that a four 

speed automatic transmission is provided for an automotive 
vehicle. Another advantage of the present invention is that 
the four-speed automatic transmission provides an arrange 
ment of planetary gearsets to achieve a 0.75 overdrive ratio. 
Yet another advantage of the present invention is that the 
four~speed automatic transmission achieves a 0.75 overdrive 
ratio while providing an acceptable ratio step between ?rst 
and second gear. Still another advantage of the present 
invention is that the four-speed automatic transmission 
provides a unique arrangement of the planetary gearsets to 
achieve a 0.75 overdrive ratio with good ratio spacing, 
especially between ?rst and second gear. 

Other objects, features and advantages of the present 
invention will be readily appreciated as the same becomes 
better understood aftm' reading the subsequent description 
taken ice conjunction with the accompanying drawings. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

FIG. 1 is a cross-sectional schematic view of a four-speed 
automatic transmission according to the present invention. 

FIG. 2 is a chart of gear rau'o and friction elements applied 
for the various normally-used gears of the four-speed auto 
matic transmission of FIGS. 1 or 3. 

FIG. 3 is a cross-sectional schematic view of ammo’ 
embodiment, according to the present invention, of the 
four-speed automatic transmission of FIG. 1. 

FIG. 4 is a chart of gear ratio and friction elements applied 
for alternative second and fourth gears of the four-speed 
automatic transmission of FIGS. 1 or 3. 

DESCRIPTION OF THE PREFERRED 
EMBODIMENT(S) 

Referring to FIG. 1, a cross-sedional schematic of a 
four-speed automatic transmission, according to the present 
invention, is partially shown at 10. The four-speed automatic 
transmission 10 is adapted for use in a vehicle (not shown) 
such as an automotive vehicle. The four-speed automatic 
transmission 10 is similar to the four-speed automatic trans 
mission disclosed in U.S. Pat. No. 4,875,391, the disclosure 
of which is hereby incaporated by refaence, except for that 
speci?cally illustrated and described herein. 
The four-speed automatic transmission 10 includes a 

transmission housing 12, an input member 14, an output 
member 16, a multi-clutch and brake assembly, generally 
indicated at 18, and a gear assembly gena'ally indicated at 
20. The transmission housing 12 is stationary relative to the 
rotatable input member 14, output member 16 and gear 
assembly 20. 
The mnlti-clutch and brake assembly 18 allows predeter 

mined gears within the gear assembly 20 to be selectively 
engaged and disengaged from either the input member 14 or 
the transmission housing 12. Near the input side of the 
transmission 10, the multi-clutch and lxake assembly 18 
includes an underdrive clutch assembly 22 (applied in ?rst, 
second and third gears), an ova'diive clutch assembly 24 
(applied in third and fourth gears) and a reverse clutch 
assembly 26 (applied in reverse gear). Near the output side 
of the transmission 10, the multLclutch and brake assembly 
18 includes a fourth brake assembly 28 (applied in fourth 
gear), a second brake assembly 30 (applied in second gear) 
and a low-reverse brake assembly 32 (applied in ?rst and 
reveres gears). 
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The underdrive clutch assembly 22 includes a plurality of 
axially spaced annular plates 22a and a plurality of axially 
spaced annular discs 22b which are alternated between the 
plates 22a and when the undm'drive clutch assembly 22 is 
not applied, these plates 22a and discs 22b are free to move 
or rotate relative to each other. The plates 22a are mounted 
to an input retainer 34 operatively connected to the input 
member 14. The discs 22b are mounted to an underdrive hub 
36 operatively connected to the gear assembly 213. 
The overdrive clutch assembly 24 includes a plurality of 

axially spaced annular plates 24a and a plurality of axially 
spaced annular discs 24b. The plates 24a and discs 24b are 
similar to those of the underdrive clutch assembly 22. The 
plates 24a are mounted to the input retainer 34 and the discs 
24b are mounted to an overdrive hub 38 operatively con 
nected to the gear assembly 20. 
The reverse clutch assembly 26 includes a plurality of 

axially spaced annular plates 26a and a plurality of axially 
spaced annular discs 26b. The plates 26a and discs 26b are 
similar to those of the underdrive clutch assembly 22. The 
plates 264 are mounted to the input retainer 34 and the discs 
26b are mounted to a reverse hub 40 operatively connected 
to the gear assembly 20. It should be appreciated that the 
clutch assemblies 22, 24 and 26 are applied by ?uid attu 
ating devices (not shown). 
The fourth brake assembly 28 includes a plurality of 

axially spaced annular plates 28:: and a plurality of axially 
spaced annular discs 28b. The plates 28a and discs 28b are 
similar to those of the underdrive clutch assembly 22. The 
plates 28a are mounted to the transmission housing 12 and 
the discs 28b are mounted to a ?rst hub 41 connected to the 
reverse hub 40. 

The second brake assembly 30 includes a plurality of 
axially spacedannularplateslitla andapluralityofaxially 
spaced annular discs 30b. The plates 30a and discs 30b are 
similar to those of the underdrive clutch assembly 22. The 
plates 300 are mounted to the transmission housing 12 and 
the discs 30b are mounted to a second hub 42 opa'atively 
connected to the gear assembly 20. 
The low/reverse brake assembly 32 includes a plurality of 

axially spacedannularplates 32aandaph1rality ofaxially 
spaced annular discs 32b. The plates 32a and discs 32b are 
similar to those of the underdrive clutch assembly 22. The 
plates 320 are mounted to the transmission housing 12 and 
the discs 32b are mounted to a ?rst connecting member 44 
of the gear assembly 20 to be described further herein. It 
should be appreciatedthatthe brake assemblies 28, 30 and 
32 are applied by ?uid atxuating devices (not shown). 
The gear assembly 20 includes a front or ?rst planetary 

gearset, generally indicated at 46, an axially spaced inter 
mediate or second planetary gearset, generally indicated at 
48, and an axially spaced rear or third planetary gearset, 
gena'ally indicated at 50. The ?rst planetary gearset 16 
includes a ?rst sun gear 52 at its center. The ?rst sun gear 52 
is connected by a second connecting member 53 to the 
second planetary gearset 48 to be described. The ?rst 
planetary gearset 46 also includes a ?rst planetary carrier 54 
having a plurality of circumferentially spaced ?rst pinion 
gears to engage the ?rst sun gear 52. The ?rst planetary 
carrier 54 is connected to the second brake assembly 30. The 
?rst planetary gearset 46 furtha' includes a ?rst annulus gear 
56 disposed about the ?rst planetary carrier 54 and which 
engages the ?rst pinion gears. The ?rst annulus gear 56 is 
connected to the reverse hub 40 and ?rst hub 41. The ratio 
ofthe numberofteethonthe sun gear52tothe numberof 
teeth on the annulus gear 56 in this example is 0.50. 
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The intermediate or second planetary gearset 48 includes 

a second sun gear 58 at its center which is connected to the 
reverse hub 40, ?rst hub 41 and ?rst annulus gear 56. The 
second planetary gearset 48 also includes a second planetary 
carrier 60 having a plurality of circumferentially spaced 
second pinion gears to engage the second sun gear 58. The 
second planetary carrier 60 includes a third connecting 
member 62 connected to the ?rst connecting member 44 and 
second connecting member 53. The second planetary carrier 
60 also is connected to the overdrive hub 38. The second 
planetary gearset 48 further includes a second annulus gear 
64 disposed about the second planetary carrier 60 and which 
engages the second pinion gears. The second annulus gear 
64 is connected by a fourth connecting member 65 to the 
third planetary gearset 50 to be described. The ratio of the 
number of teeth on the sun gear 58 to the number of teeth on 
the annulus gear 64 in this example is 0.33. 
The rear or third planetary gearset 50 includes a third sun 

gear 66 at its center which is connected to the underdrive 
hub 36. The third planetary gearset 50 also includes a third 
planetary carrier 68 having a plurality of circumferentially 
spaced third pinion gears to engage the third sun gear 66. 
The third planetary carria- 68 is connected to the fourth 
connecting member 65 and to the output member 16 of the 
transmission 10. The third planetary gearset 50 further 
includes a third annulus gear 70 disposed about the third 
planetary carrier 68 and which engages the third pinion 
gears. The third annulus gear 70 is connected to the ?rst 
connecting membm44. The ?rst connecting member 44 is 
connected to a one-way or ?-eewheel clutch 72 to prevent 
reverse rotation of the ?rst connecting member 44. The ratio 
ofthennmberofteethonthe sungear66tothenumberof 
teeth on the annulus gear 70 in this example is 0.50. 

In operation, the input member 14 of the transmission 10 
rotates due to torque being transferred from the rotating 
crankshaft of the engine and through the torque converter 
(not shown) to the input member 14. The input retainer 34 
also rotates with the input member 14 due to its connection. 
The input retainer 34 and plates 22a, 24a, 26a also rotate 
with the input member 14 due to the connection of the input 
retainer 34 to the input membe- 14. 
When the underdrive clutch assembly 22 is applied, the 

rotating plates 22a and discs 22b of the underdrive clutch 
assembly 22 engage each 0th: and a frictional force is 
produced between the plates 22a and discs 22b. Because the 
input retainer 34 and plates 22a are rotating, the frictional 
force causes the discs 22b and underdrive hub 36 to rotate, 
inurrn,rotatingthe sungear66ofthethirdplanetary gearset 
50 
When the overdrive clutch assembly 24 is applied, the 

rotating plates 24a and discs 24b of the overdrive clutch 
assembly 24 engage each othu' and a frictional force is 
produced between the plates 24a and discs 24b. Because the 
input retaina 34 and plates 24:: are rotating, the frictional 
force causes the discs 24b and overdrive hub 38 to rotate, in 
tum, rotating the second planetary carrim' 60, third connect 
ing member 62, ?rst connecting member 44, second con 
necting member 53, ?rst sun gear 52 and third annulus gear 
70. 
When the reverse clutch assembly 26 is applied, the 

rotating plates 26a and discs 26b of the reverse clutch 
assembly 26 engage each other and a frictional force is 
produced between the plates 26a and discs 26b. Because the 
input retainu' 34 and plates 26:: are rotating, the frictional 
force causes the discs 26b and reverse hub 40 to rotate, in 
turn, rotating the second sun gear 58 and ?rst annulus gear 
56. 
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When the fourth brake assembly 28 is applied, the plates 
28a and discs 28b of the fourth brake assembly 28 engage 
each other and a frictional force is produced between the 
plates 28a and discs 28b. Because the plates 28a do not 
rotate or are stationary, as they are connected to the trans 
mission hcusing 12, the frictional force holds the discs 28b 
and ?rst hub 41 stationary, in turn, holding the second sun 
gear 58 and ?rst annulus gear 56 stationary. 
When the second brake assembly 30 is applied, the plates 

30a and discs 3% of the second brake assembly 30 engage 
each other and a frictional force is produced between the 
plates 30a and discs 30b. Because the plates 30a are 
stationary, as they are connected to the transmission housing 
12, the frictional force holds the discs 3% and second hub 
42 stationary, in turn, holding the ?rst planetary carrier 54 of 
the ?rst planetary gearset 46 stationary. 
When the low/reverse brake assembly 32 is applied, the 

plates 32a and discs 32b of the low/reverse brake assembly 
32 engage each other and a frictional force is produced 
between the plates 32a and discs 3212. Because the plates 320 
are stationary, as they are connected to the transmission 
housing 12, the frictional force holds the discs 32b 
stationary, in turn, holding the ?rst connecting member 44, 
second connecting member 53, ?rst sun gear 52, third 
connecting membm' 62, second planetary carrier 60, and 
third annulus gear 70 stationary. 

Referring to FIG. 2, when the transmission 10 is desired 
to operate in ?rst gear, the underdrive clutch assembly 22 is 
applied This causes the third sun gear 66 to rotate and thee 
third annulus gear 70 to be bold stationary by the one-way 
clutch 72. As a result, rotation of the third sun gear 66 causes 
rotation of the third pinion gears and the third planetary 
carrier 68. Because the output membu' 16 is connected to the 
third planetary carrier 68, rotation of the third planetary 
carrier 68 causes the output member 16 to rotate. This 
arrangement of the gear assembly 20 produces a gear ratio 
of 3.00. 
When the transmission 10 is desired to operate in second 

gear, the underdrive clutch assembly 22 and the second 
brakes assembly 30 are applied. This causes the ?iird sun 
gear66tcrotate andthe?rstplanetarycan-ier54tcbeheld 
stationary By holding the ?rst planetary carrier 54 stationary, 
the ?rst sun gear 52 andthird annulus gear 70 rotate, in turn, 
further rotating the third pinion gears and the third planetary 
carrier 68 which increase in speed. As a result, the third 
planetary carrier 68 and output member 16 rotate at a greater 
r.p.m. than in ?rst gear. This arrangement of the gear 
assembly 20 produces a gear ratio of 1.67. 
When the transmission 10 is desired to operate in third 

gear, the underdrive clutch assembly 22 and the overdrive 
clutch assembly 24 are applied. ‘This causes the third sun 
gear 66 and third annulus gear 70 to rotate at the same r.p.m. 
As a result, the third planetary carrier 68 and output member 
16 also rotate at the sauna r.p.m., which is at a higher r.p.m. 
than in second gear. This arrangement of the gear assembly 
20 produces a gear ratio of 1.00. 
When the transmission 10 is desired to operate in fourth 

gear, the overdrive clutch assembly 24 and the fourth brakes 
assembly 28 are applied. This causes the second planetary 
carrier 60 to rotate and the second sun gear 58 to be held 
stationary. As a result, rotation of the second planet carrier 
60 causes the second pinion gears and second annulus gear 
64 to rotate. Rotation of the second annulus gear 64 causes 
the output member 16 to rotate at a greatm r.p.rn. than in 
third gear. This arrangement of the gear assembly 20 pro 
duces a gear ratio of 0.75. 
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When the transmission 10 is desired to operate in reverse 

gear, the reverse clutch assembly 26 and low/reverse brake 
assembly 32 are applied. This causes the second sun gear 58 
to rotate and the second planetary carrier 60 to be held 
stationary. As a result, the second sun gear 58 rotates the 
second pinion gezn's which, in turn, rotate the second annulus 
gear 64 backwards. Rotation of the second annulus gear 64 
causes rotation of the output member 16 in a direction 
opposite to the other gear positions. This arrangement of the 
gear assembly 20 produces a gear ration of —3 .00. 

Referring to FIG. 3, another embodiment 110 of the 
four-speed automatic transmission 10 is shown. Like parts of 
the four-speed automatic transmission 16 have like reference 
numerals increased by one hundred (100). The gear assem 
bly 120 includes a ?'ont or ?rst planetary gearset, generally 
indicated at 146, an axially spaced intermediate or second 
planetary gearset, generally indicated at 148, and an axially 
spaced rear or third planetary gearset, generally indicated at 
150. The ?rst planetary gearset 146 includes a ?rst sun gear 
152 at its centm'. The ?rst sun gear 152 is connected to the 
overdrive hub 138. The ?rst planetary gearset 146 also 
includes a ?rst planetary carrier 154 having a plurality of 
circumfcrentially spaced ?rst pinion gears to engage the ?rst 
sun gear 152. The ?rst planetary can-ier 154 is connected to 
the second hub 142 of me second brake assembly 130. The 
?rst planetary gearset 146 further includes a ?rst annulus 
gear 156 disposed about thus ?rst planetary carrier 154 and 
which engages the ?rst pinion gears. The ?rst annulus gear 
156 is connected to the ?rst hub 141 of the fourth brake 
assembly 128. The ratio of the number of teeth on the sun 
gear 152 to the number of teeth on the annulus gear 156 in 
this example is 0.50. 
The intermediate or second planetary gearset 148 includes 

a second sun gear 158 at its center which is connected to the 
second hub 142 of the second brake assembly 130. The 
second planetary gearset 148 also includes a second plan 
etary carrier 160 having a plurality of circumferentially 
spaced second pinion gears to engage the second sun gear 
158. The second planetary carrier 160 is connected to the 
?rstconnectingmember 144 and tcthe?rstsun gear 152 and 
overdrive clutch hub 138. The second planetary gearset 148 
further includes a second annulus gear 164 disposed about 
the second planetary carrier 160 and which engages the 
second pinion gears. The second annulus gear 164 is con 
neaed to the third planetary gearset 150 to be described. The 
ratioofthe numberofteethonthesungear 158tothe 
numba' of teeth on the annulus gear 164 in this example is 
0.50 
The rear or third planetary gearset 150 includes a third sun 

gear 166 at its center which in connected to the undu'drive 
hub 136. The third planetary gearset 150 also includes a third 
planetary carrier 168 having a plurality of circumferentially 
spaced third pinion gears to engage the third sun gear 166. 
The third planetary carrier 68 includes a connecting member 
169 connected to the second annulus gear 164. The third 
planetary carrier 168 is also connected to the output member 
116 of the transmission 110. The third planetary gearset 150 
further includes a third annulus gear 170 disposed about the 
third planetary carrier 168 and which engages the third 
pinion gears. The third annulus gear 170 is connected to the 
?rst connecting member 144. The ?rst connecting member 
144 is connected to a one-way or freewheel ciutch 172 to 
prevent revase rotation of the ?rst connecting member 144. 
The ratio of the munber of teeth on the sun gear 166 to the 
number of teeth on the annulus gear 1'70 in this example is 
0.50. 

In operation, the input member 114 of the transmission 
110 rotates due to torque being transferred from the rotating 
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crankshaft of the engine and through the torque converter 
(not shown) to the input member 114. The input retainer 134 
also rotates with the input member 114 due to its connection. 
The input retainer 134 and plates 122a, IMa, 126a also 
rotate with the input member 114 due to the connection of 
the input retainer 134 to the input member 114. 
When the underdrive clutch assembly 122 is applied. the 

rotating plates 122a and discs 122b of the underdrive clutch 
assembly 122 engage each other and a frictional force is 
produced between the plates 122a and discs 1222:. Because 
the input retainm' 134 and plates 1220 are rotating, the 
frictional force causes the discs 1222) and underdrive hub 
136 to rotate, in tin-n, rotating the sun gear 166 of the third 
planetary gearset 150. 
When the overdrive clutch assembly 124 is applied, the 

rotating plates 124a and discs 1241: of the overdrive clutch 
assembly 124 engage each other and a frictional force is 
produced between the plates 124a and discs 124b. Because 
the input retainer 134 and plates 1240 are rotating, the 
frictional force causes the discs 124b and overdrive hub 138 
to rotate, in turn, rotating the ?rst sun gear 152 and the 
second planetary carrier 160, ?rst connecting member 144, 
and third annulus gear 170. 
When the reverse clutch assembly 126 is applied, the 

rotating plates 126a and discs 126b of the reverse clutch 
assembly 126 engage each other and a frictional force is 
produced between the plates 126a and discs 126b. Because 
the input retainer 134 and plates 1260 are rotating, the 
frictional force causes the discs 126b and reverse hub 140 
and ?rst hub 141 to rotate, in turn, rotating the ?rst annulus 
gear 156. 
When the fourth brake assembly 128 is applied, the plates 

128aand discs l28bofthe fourthbrakeassembly128 
engage each other and a frictional force is produced between 
the plates 128a and discs 13b. Because the plates 128a do 
not rotate or are stationary, as they are connected to the 
transmission housing 112, the frictional force holds the discs 
128b and ?rst hub 141 stationary, in turn, holding the ?rst 
annulus gear 156 stationary. 
When the second brake assembly 130 is applied, the 

plates 130a and discs 13017 of the second brake assembly 
130 engage each other and a frictional force in produced 
between the plates 130a and discs 130b. Because the plates 
1304 are stationary, as they are connected to the transmis 
sion housing 112, the frictional fm'ce holds the discs 130b 
and second hub 142 stationary, in turn, holding the ?rst 
planetary carrier 154 of the ?rst planetary gearset 146 and 
the second sun gear 158 of the second planetary gearset 148 
stationary. 
When the low/reverse brake assembly 132 is applied, the 

plates 132a and discs 13712 of the low/reva'se brake assem 
bly 132 engage each other and a frictional force is produced 
between the plates 132a and discs 132b. Because the plates 
1320 are stationary, as they are conneaed to the transmis 
sion housing 112, the frictional force holds the discs 132b 
stationary, in turn, holding the ?rst connecting member 144, 
second planetary carrier 160, ?rst sun gear 152 and third 
annulus gear 170 stationary. 

Referring to FIG. 3, when the transmission 110 is desired 
to operate in ?rst gear, the underdrive clutch assembly 122 
is applied. This causes the third sun gear 166 to rotate and 
the third annulus gear 170 to be held stationary by the 
one-way clutch 172. As a result, rotation of the third sun gear 
166 causes rotation of the third pinion gears and the third 
planetary carrier 168. Because the output member 116 is 
connected to this third planetary carria' 168, rotation of the 
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third planetary carrier 168 causes the output member 116 to 
rotate. This arrangement of the gear assembly 120 produces 
a gear ratio of 3.00. 
When the transmission 110 is desired to operate in second 

gear, the underdrive clutch assembly 122 and the second 
brake assembly 130 are applied. This causes the third sun 
gear 166 to rotate and the second sun gear 158 to be held 
stationary. By holding the second sun gear 158 stationary, 
the third annulus gear 170 rotates, in turn, further rotating 
the third pinion gears and the third planetary carrier 168 
which increase in speed. As a result, the third planetary 
carrier 168 and output member 116 rotate at a greater r.p.m. 
than in ?rst gear. This arrangement of the gear assembly 120 
produces a gear ratio of 1.67. 
When the transmission 110 is desired to opa'ate in third 

gear, the underdrive clutch assembly 122 and the overdrive 
clutch assembly 124 are applied. This causes the third sun 
gear 166 and the third annulus gear 170 to rotate at the same 
r.p.m. As a result, the third planetary carria- 168 and output 
member 116 also rotate at the same r.p.m., which is at a 
higher r.p.m. than in second gear. This arrangement of the 
gear assembly 120 produces a gear ratio of 1.00. 
When the transmission 110 is desired to operate in fourth 

gear, the overdrive clutch assembly 124 and the fourth brake 
assembly 128 are applied. This causes the ?rst sun gear 152 
and second planetary carrier 160 to rotate and the ?rst 
annulus gear 156 to be held stationary which causes the ?rst 
planetary carrier 154 and second sun gear 158 to rotate. As 
a result, rotation of the second planetary carrier 160 causes 
the second pinion gears and second annulus gem‘ 164 to 
rotate. Rotation of the second annulus gear 164 causes the 
output member 116 to rotate at a great: r.p.m. than in third 
gear. This arrangement of the gear assembly 120 produces a 
gear ratio of 0.75. 
When the transmission 110 is desired to opa'ate in reverse 

gear, the revu'se clutch assembly 126 and low/reverse brake 
assembly 132 are applied This causes the ?rst annulus gear 
156 to rotate and the second planetary carrier 160 and ?rst 
sun gear 152 to be held stationary. As a result, the ?rst 
planetary carrier 154 and second sun gear 158 rotate the 
second pinion gears which, in turn, rotate the second annulus 
gear 164 backwards. Rotation of the second annulus gear 
164 causes rotation of the output member 116 in a direction 
opposite to the other gear positions. This arrangement of the 
gear assembly 120 p'oduces a gear ratio of -3.00. 

Referring to FIG. 4, altu'native second and fourth gear 
ratios are available for the four-speed automatic transmis 
sion 10,110 by applying the fourth brake 28,128 instead of 
the second brake 30,130 in second gear, which gives a ratio 
of 1.50 with either of the transmissions 10 or 110. Applying 
the second lrake 30,130 instead of the fourth brake 28,128 
in fourth gear gives a ratio of 0.67. These alternative ratios 
may be useful in certain situations. 

Accordingly, the four-speed automatic transmission 
10,110 has a unique arrangement of the planetary gearsets 
46,146, 48,148 and 50,150 to achieve a 0.75 overdrive ratio 
in fourth gear and a satisfactory ?rst to second step of 3.00 
to 1.67. The unique arrangement of the planetary gearsets 
46, 48 and 50 results in loading only the second planetary 
gearset 48 in fourth gear, thereby reducing e?iciency loss. 
The present invention has been described in an illustrative 

manner. It is to be understood that the taminology which 
has been used is intended to be in the nature of words of 
description rather than of limitation. 
Many modi?cations and variations of the present inven 

tion are possible in light of the above teachings. Therefore, 
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within the scope of the appended claims, the present inven 
tion may be practiced other than as speci?cally described. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle 

comprising: 
a transmission housing; 

an input member; 
an output member; 
three planetary gearsets for changing a ratio of torque 

between said input member and said output member; 
a plurality of clutch assemblim to selectively couple said 

input member to predetermined gears of said planetary 
gearsets and a plurality of brake assemblies to selec 
tively couple predetermined gears of said planetary 
gearsets to said transmission housing; 

means for allowing said output member and a planetary 
carrier from one of said planetary gearsets and an 
annulus gear of another of said planetary gearsets to 
rotate simultaneously; 

said planetary gearsets comprising a ?rst planetary 
gearset, a second planetary gearset axially spaced from 
said ?rst planetary gearset and a third planetary gearset 
axially spaced from said second planetary gearset; 

each of said ?rst, second and third planetary gearsets 
comprising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
carrier having a plurality of circumfm'entially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; and 

said clutch assemblies comprising a ?rst clutch assembly 
to couple said input member to said sun gear of said 
third planetary gearset, a second clutch assembly inde 
pendent of said ?rst clutch assembly to couple said 
input member to said planetary carrier of said second 
planetary gearset and said ?rst sun gear of said ?rst 
planetary gearset, and a third clutch assembly to couple 
said input member to said annulus gear of said ?rst 
planetary gearset. 

2. A four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle 
comprising: 

a transmission housing; 
an input membm'; 
an output member; 
three planetary gearsets for changing a ratio of torque 

between said input member and said output member; 
a plurality of clutch assemblies to selectively couple said 

input member to predetermined gears of said planetary 
gearsets and a plurality of brake assemblies to selec 
tively couple predetermined gears of said planetary 
gearsets to said transmission housing; 

means for allowing said output member and a planetary 
carrier from one of said planetary gearsets and an 
annulus gear of another of said planetary gearsets to 
rotate simultaneously; 

said planetary gearsets comprising a ?rst planetary 
gearset, a second planetary gearset axially spaced from 
said ?rst planetary gearset and a third planetary gearset 
axially spaced from said second planetary gearset; 

each of said ?rst, second and third planetary gearsets 
comprising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
canier having a plurality of cireumfaentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; and 

said brake assemblies comprising a ?rst brake assembly to 
couple said transmission housing to said annulus gear 
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of said ?rst planetary gearset, a second brake assembly 
to couple said transmission housing to said planetary 
carrier of said ?rst planetary gearset and said sun gear 
of said second planetary gearset. and a third brake 
assembly to couple said transmission housing to said 
annulus gear of said third planetary gearset, said plau 
etary carrier of said second planetary gearset, and said 
sun gear of said ?rst planetary gearset. 

3. A gear assembly for a four~speed automatic transmis— 
sion of a vehicle for changing a ratio of torque between an 
input member and an output member, said gear assembly 
comprising: 

a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 

planetary gearset; 
each of said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets 

comprising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
carrier- having a plurality of cirwmferentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset to rotate simultaneously; 

means for allowing said sun gear of said second planetary 
gearset and said planetary carrier of said ?rst planetary 
gearset to rotate simultaneously; and 

a clutch assembly for coupling said planetary carrier of 
said second planetary gearset to said input member. 

4. A four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle 
comprising: 

a transmission housing; 
an input member; 
an output member; 
a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 

planetary gearset; 
said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets com 

prising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
carrier having a plurality of circumfa'entially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset and said output membq' to rotate 
simultaneously; 

a brake assembly to selectively couple said planetary 
carrier of said ?rst planetary gearset to said transmis 
sion housing to remain stationary simultaneously; 

means for allowing said sun gear of said second planetary 
gearset and said annulus gear of said ?rst planetary 
gearset to rotate simultaneously; and 

means for allowing said planetary carrier of said second 
planetary gearset and said annulus gear of said third 
planetary gearset to rotate simultaneously. 

5. A gear assembly for a four-speed automatic transmis 
sion of a vehicle for changing a ratio of torque between an 
input member and an output member, said gear assembly 
comprising: 

a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
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a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 
planetary gearset; 

each of said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets 
comprising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
can'ier having a plurality of circumferentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset to rotate simultaneously; 

means for allowing said sun gear of said second planetary 
gearset and said planetary carrier of said ?rst planetary 
gearset to rotate simultaneously; and 

a brake assembly to selectively couple said planetary 
carrier of said ?rst planetary gearset to a transmission 
housing. 

6. A gear assembly for a four-speed automatic transmis 
sion of a vehicle for changing a ratio of torque between an 
input member and an output member, said gear assembly 
comprising: 

a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 

planetary gearset; 
each of said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets 

comprising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
carrier having a plurality of circumferentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset to rotate simultaneously; 

means for allowing said sun gear of said second planetary 
gearset and said planetary carrier of said ?rst planetary 
gearset to rotate simultaneously; and 

a brake assembly to selectively couple said annulus gear 
of said third planetary gearset to a transmission hous 
mg. 

7. A four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle 
OQIIIPIiSiIIsI 
a transmission housing; 
an input memba; 
an output member; 
a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 

Planetary gearset; 
said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets com 

prising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
can'ier having a plurality of circumferentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset and said output member to rotate 
simultaneously; 

a brake assembly to selectively couple said planetary 
carrier of said ?rst planetary gearset to said transmis 
sion housing to remain stationary simultaneously; 

means for allowing said sun gear of said second planetary 
gearset and said annulus gear of said ?rst planetary 
gearset to rotate simultaneously; and 

12 
a clutch assembly to selectively couple said planetary 

carrier of said second planetary gearset to said input 
member. 

8. A four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle 
5 comprising: 

35 

40 

50 

SS 

65 

a transmission housing; 
an input member; 
an output member; 
a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 

planetary gearset; 
said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets com 

prising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
carrier having a plurality of circumferentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset and said output member to rotate 
simultaneously; 

a ?rst brake assembly to selectively couple said planetary 
carrier of said ?rst planetary gearset to said transmis 
sion housing to remain stationary simultaneously; and 

a ?rst clutch assembly to selectively couple said input 
member to said sun gear of said second planetary 
gearset and said annulus gear of said ?rst planetary 
gearset to rotate simultaneously. 

9. A four-speed automatic transmission for a vehicle 
comprising: 

a transmission housing; 
an input member; 
an output member; 
a ?rst planetary gearset; 
a second planetary gearset axially spaced from said ?rst 

planetary gearset; 
a third planetary gearset axially spaced from said second 

planetary gearset; 
said ?rst and second and third planetary gearsets com 

prising a sun gear, an annulus gear and a planetary 
carrier having a plurality of circumferentially spaced 
pinion gears disposed between said sun gear and said 
annulus gear; 

?rst means for allowing said annulus gear of said second 
planetary gear-sq and said planetary carrier of said third 
planetary gearset and said output membu' to rotate 
simultaneously; 

second means for allowing said sun gear of said ?rst 
planetary gearset and said planetary carrier of said 
second planetary gearset and said annulus gear of said 
third planetary gearset to remain stationary or to rotate 
simultaneously; 

third means for allowing said sun gear of said second 
planetary gearset and said annulus gear of said ?rst 
planetary gearset to remain stationary or to rotate 
simultaneously; 

a ?rst brake assembly to selectively couple said sun gear 
of said second planetary gearset and said annulus gear 
of said ?rst planetary gearset to said transmission 
housing; 

a second brake assembly to selectively couple said plan 
etary carria- of ?rst planetary gearset to said transmis 
sion to remain stationary simultaneously; 
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a third brake assembly to selectively couple said sun gear etary gearset and said sun gear of said ?rst planetary 
of said ?rst planetary gearset and said planetary carrier gearset and said annulus gear of said third planetary 
of said second planetary gearset and said annulus gear gwset; and 
°f “9d thud Plf‘l'emé’ gem?‘ ‘° “"1 'Iansmlssm a third clutch assembly to selectively couple said input 
housing to remain stationary simultaneously; memba to said sun gear of Said second Planetary 

a ?rst clutch assembly to selectively couple said input gain-sat and Said annulus gem- of said ?rst planetary 
member to said sun gear of said third planetary gearset; gearsct to rotate Simultaneously. 

a second clutch assembly to selectively couple said input 
member to said planetary carrier of said second plan- * * * * * 


